
11-0034

 
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for 

FOR: Water Meter Strainers

TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2012)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 28, 2011
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

*   

120 ea.  (SAWS #16282) UNIT 170.00 185.00 236.84 186.00
Strainer for 2" turbine water meter PRICE 20,400.00 22,200.00 35,526.00 22,320.00

1. Make & Model Quoting TOTAL Master Meter 907-200-TSA Mars #252820WH Badger Plate Strainer Elster AMCO #HSD5921

   *

30 ea. (SAWS #16283) UNIT 326.00 340.00  271.00

Strainer for 3" turbine water meter PRICE 9,780.00 10,200.00 NO BID 8,130.00
2. Make & Model Quoting TOTAL Master Meter 907-300-TSA Mars #252807WH  Elster AMCO #HSD5922

   *

15 ea.  (SAWS #16284) UNIT 521.00 476.00  409.00

Strainer for 4" turbine water meter PRICE 7,815.00 7,140.00 NO BID 6,135.00
3. Make & Model Quoting TOTAL Master Meter 907-400-TSA Mars #252806WH  Elster AMCO #HSE5922

*

10 ea.  (SAWS #16285) UNIT 766.00 662.00 688.50 677.00
Strainer for 6" turbine water meter PRICE 7,660.00 6,620.00 6,885.00 6,770.00

4. Make & Model Quoting TOTAL Master Meter 907-400-TSA Mars #252860WH Badger Plate Strainer Elster AMCO #HSG5922

*

2 ea.  (SAWS #16286) UNIT 1,036.00 795.00  767.00

Strainer for 8" turbine water meter PRICE 2,072.00 1,590.00 NO BID 1,534.00

5. Make & Model Quoting TOTAL Master Meter 907-600-TSA Mars #252880WH  Elster AMCO STR43

 *  

2 ea.  (SAWS #16281) UNIT 2,042.00 882.00  1,060.00

Strainer for 10" turbine water meter PRICE 4,084.00 1,764.00 NO BID 2,120.00

6. Make & Model Quoting TOTAL Master Meter 907-900-TSA Mars #252900WH  Elster AMCO 10" STR47

 

Manufacturer Master Meter Mars Co. Badger Meter, Inc. Elster AMCO Water, LLC 

 

 

Price Sheet Strainers built to spec Upon Request   

  

 

Date  July 20, 2011  July 26, 2011

    

 Mars Provides  

Discount  Utility Pricing  N/A

TOTAL TOTAL    

EXTENSION 1  

 

EXTENSION 2  

 

 

EXTENSION 3  

 

Net Net  Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

 
  2" strainers 30 days  

Delivery Days 15 days 15-30 days 6" strainers 7 days 30 days

 

*DENOTES LOW BIDDER   

 

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

Act Pipe & Supply Mueller Systems Demandstar

 Badger Meter, Inc. Municipal Water Works SAWS Website

Elster AMCO Water, Inc. Neptune Technology Group

Ferguson Performance Meter, Inc.

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. PMI Steel Pipe

Hersey Meters USA Blue Book

Master Meter William Supply Co.

Morrison Supply
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